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From: David Burke
To: Allen E. Simard
Cc: Sandy" via Jacob"s Property Committee; David Mullin; Catherine Stevens
Subject: RE: United Church of Underhill Project
Date: Monday, March 01, 2021 10:39:01 AM

Allen: See below for replies.
 
David
 

From: Allen E. Simard [mailto:alsimard@eselectriccompany.com] 
Sent: Friday, February 26, 2021 1:53 PM
To: David Burke
Cc: Sandy' via Jacob's Property Committee; David Mullin; Catherine Stevens
Subject: United Church of Underhill Project
 
Hi David,
 

                How are you? Good – I hope you are as well. I just left you a voice mail message. I
wanted to give you an update on our progress on the housing project we are working on. Received
as well as your statement of following up with e-mail, so I thought replying to the e-mail would be
best.
 

·         We are told that the Martelle boundary line adjustment has been delayed until this fall. So
Phil Jacobs is going to ask you to begin work on the United Church of Underhill boundary line
adjustment. We would like you to get everything ready to submit, but not actually submit it
to the Town until after we hear the results from our Grant request we are currently working

on.  That Grant process should be completed sometime in June. I spoke with Paul
O’Leary and Phil asked that we move forward on his two Lots which
require a “Master Plan” which brings in the Church property. This work is
on our list but between you and I not high as Phil has a long standing
substantial past due and the work will likely just add to it. The Master
Plan and his two lots will likely need to be completed before an actual
Proposal can be done on the “Church” Parcel. His “Master Plan” work
should include and allow for the sale of the yet to be officially created
“Church” lot.

·         We have already alloyed for a $10,000 feasibility Grant, which has been approved.
·         We are currently applying for a $60,000 VCDP Planning Grant. We have had several meeting

with the people who oversee this grant and they are guiding us through the process to apply
for it. In a nut shell we have to meet a number of requirements. Part of this is already getting
completed via the Town Selectboard, Planning Commission and DRB.

·         We are not allowed to complete the purchase of this property until the Planning Grant has
been approved. They know we have a Agreement in place with Phil and that we made a
deposit. We cannot actually do the property line adjustment until the Grant is approved,
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otherwise we will be disqualified from the Grant. As stated above, the “Master
Plan” work for Phil needs to be completed before the “Church” parcel is
official and can be conveyed to then start that process. This is likely 6
months.

·         As part of the planning grant I need to provide them with a planning budget and back that
up with some costs estimates.

 
So I am wondering if you can provide me with a budget for Engineering work. I’m thinking that
the Planning Grant will cover most of your work on this project that comes after the boundary
line adjustment. But not cover the actual work that comes with the building process. So we
would like some sort of budget that would cover the test pits, septic design, road design,
property line layout with building envelopes, surface water management, basically all the
engineering work you would be doing for us along with attending the DRB meetings. I had asked
you about this earlier, and you had thought it would be something like $35,000, which in line
with my Packard Road project. I suspect there will be a few additional items due to the Grant
requirements, so you might like to add to that number for any extra work you would need to do.
I would think $40,000 is a reasonable conservative figure or $50,000 should Act 250 be
required.
 
I would also would like your feedback on the attached ACT 250 Amendment. It seems to read
like Affordable Housing projects don’t have to follow all of the ACT 250 requirements. Do you
know anything about this Amendment? The housing for this project will be completed by Habitat
for Humanity which do perpetually affordable housing contracts. Do you think this might apply

to our project? Could you give me some feedback on what you think this section means? See
reply to separate e-mail.
 
Future plan: If we receive the Planning Grant or not, we plan to have you move ahead with the
engineering work this summer. We plan to apply for another Grant that would help with the
actual project. This planning Grant is intended to help get us to the real Grant. It’s all steps along
the way. We’re in hopes that the actual building will begin sometime in 2022.
 

Thank you,
 
Al

 
 

               
 

Allen E. Simard
50 Beartown Road



Underhill, VT 05489
(802) 316-6818 (Cell)

(802) 448-3485 ext.106
 



From: David Burke
To: Allen E. Simard
Subject: RE: Act 250 Jurisdiction
Date: Monday, March 01, 2021 9:34:31 AM

Allen: The below is something that we and/or you guys can verify with Act 250, but it sounds as
though it should wait so it doesn’t affect your desired Grant.
 
David
 

From: David Burke 
Sent: Wednesday, February 03, 2021 4:02 PM
To: Allen E. Simard
Subject: Re: Act 250 Jurisdiction
 
Ok!

Sent from my iPhone

On Feb 3, 2021, at 1:25 PM, Allen E. Simard <alsimard@eselectriccompany.com> wrote:

﻿
Hi David,
 
                The email below is something I just received and wanted to pass on to you. Looks like it
might be a way for us to do the project and avoid  the ACT 250 costs and fees.
 
Al Simard
 
               
               
 

E&S Electric Company
50 Beartown Road

Underhill, VT 05489
Al Simard

(802) 316-6818 (Cell)
(802) 448-3485 ext.106

 

From: David Mullin [mailto:dmullin@vermonthabitat.org] 
Sent: Wednesday, February 03, 2021 12:40 PM
To: Allen E. Simard <alsimard@eselectriccompany.com>
Subject: FW: Act 250 Jurisdiction
 
Good afternoon Al,
I wanted to pass along to you this Act 250 Amendment.  Because the homes we build are perpetually
affordable this applies to us.
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Amendment language was:
 

10 VSA Sec 6001(3)(C)(v):  Permanently affordable housing. Notwithstanding subdivisions (3)
(A)(iv) and (19) of this section, jurisdiction shall be determined exclusively by counting
affordable housing units, as defined by this section, that are subject to housing subsidy
covenants as defined in 27 V.S.A. § 610 that preserve their affordability for a period of 99
years or longer, provided the affordable housing units are located in a discrete project on a
single tract or multiple contiguous tracts of land, regardless of whether located within an
area designated under 24 V.S.A. chapter 76A.

 
10 VSA Sec 6001(3)(A)(iv) defines housing unit jurisdiction as 10 units in 5 yr within 5 miles.
 
10 VSA Sec 6001(19) defines subdivision jurisdiction as 10 lots in 5 years within district.
 
So Act 250 jurisdiction over affordable housing projects only applies if the number of contiguous
units is greater than 10 in 5 years, whether single family, duplex, or multifamily configuration.  That
is how we understand this.
 
The Engineer may not be aware of this because of the unique segment  of developer market that it
covers.   This would not cover anything Phil is doing, but it should apply to the development of the
land that the Church owns.
 
 
David
 
 
 
 
David Mullin
Green Mountain Habitat for Humanity
Executive Director
www.vermonthabitat.org
802-872-8726
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United Church of Underhill
7 Park Street
Underhill, VT 05489
(802) 899-1722 Phone

Attn: Affordable Housing Committee

Re: Test Pits

      This is not a fixed price contract. E&S Electric Company LLC is providing this pricing to establish a budget in  accordance with the job description.
If awarded, this project is expected to be completed for the sum of One Thousand Five Hundred ($1,500.00) dollars.

Bid Breakdown: Labor: 1,500.00$        
Material: -$                 

Proposal is based on the following:

- Digging of test pit at the direction of the Engineer
- Filling test pit holes
- This proposal does not include finish raking, topsoil or seeded of test pit hole

This work can be done on a T&M basis

     

One Thousand Five Hundred and 00/100 -----------------------------------------------------------------------------------dollars 1,500.00$           

Payment to be made as follows: NET 30 DAYS

ACCEPTANCE OF PROPOSAL:  The above prices, specifications, terms and conditions are hereby accepted.  E&S Electric is authorized to do the work as specified.

It is understood and agreed that this work is not provided for in any other agreement and no other contractual rights arise until this proposal is accepted in writing.

Date of Acceptance

By

By By

Note:  This proposal may be withdrawn by us if not accepted within 30 days.        Allen Simard, Estimator

March 5, 2021

workmanlike manner. This is not a fixed price contract. It is expected that this project could be completed for the sum of:

BUDGETARY PRICING
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WE PROPOSE to perform the work as stated in this contract in accordance with the specifications and plans submitted and completed in a 

Respectfully submitted,

E & S  ELECTRIC COMPANY, LLC
50 BEARTOWN ROAD, UNDERHILL, VERMONT  05489

Phone (802) 448-3485  /  Fax (802) 899-2249
E-MAIL AlSimard@ESElectricCompany.com



From: Andrew Strniste
To: Allen E. Simard
Subject: RE: United Church of Underhill - Affordable Housing Project
Date: Friday, March 05, 2021 11:09:54 AM

Good morning Allen,
 
I want to apologize for my delayed response in getting back to you.  At this stage of the process,
estimating the cost is somewhat challenging given that the project is more or less in the conceptual
stage; however, I will do my best in trying to help navigate through the costs:
 

You’ll receive an access permit as part of the Development Review Board process, which
approve the road layout and each one of the driveways.  The cost of the permit itself is $50.00,
a $15.00 posting fee, as well as $15.00 per page of recording.  The number of pages being
recorded is a bit of a wildcard here, as it could potentially be recording the plan relating to the
road and then one for each driveway.  It will depend on how the site is designed and depicted
on the plans.
You’ll be able to calculate the cost of building permits for the structures by referring to the
Town’s fee schedule (please click here).  The main takeaway of the fee chart is that all living
space and attached garages are $0.50 per square foot, while attached structures like decks and
porches are $0.25 per square foot.
There are also costs associated with the DRB’s applications, such as application fees, notices to
the neighbors etc.  The application fees can be found within fee schedule itself using the link
above.  Notice to the neighbors is certified mail, return receipt, which runs around $7.00 per
mailing.  Since an application will likely be considered a re-subdivision, there will be
somewhere around 30 mailings.  There will be posting fees for the hearing itself, the decision,
and then every permit issued for the construction at each lot ($15.00).  Additionally, the
Burlington Free Press notice runs somewhere between $200.00 and $250.00.  The decision and
associated permits will need to be recorded at $15.00. 

As you may be aware, the Development Review Board will be seeking a masterplan as it
relates to the subdivision of land in the field.  As a result, this may lead to a longer
decision due to a greater number exhibits to review.  Our subdivision decisions typically
range of 15-18 pages; however, given the nature of the project, I envision the decision
being between 20 and 22 pages, perhaps longer.

 
I am not sure if that covers everything you are looking for; however, please be sure to tell me if it does
not and I can provide some more insight.
 
Thank you and kind regards,
 
Andrew Strniste
Planning Director
Zoning Administrator
Town of Underhill
P.O. Box 120
Underhill, VT 05489
Phone #: (802) 899-4434 x6
Fax #: (802) 899-2137
astrniste@underhillvt.gov
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From: Allen E. Simard <alsimard@eselectriccompany.com> 
Sent: Saturday, February 27, 2021 10:56 AM
To: Andrew Strniste <astrniste@underhillvt.gov>
Cc: Sandy' via Jacob's Property Committee <land@ucu.church>; David Mullin
<dmullin@vermonthabitat.org>; Catherine Stevens <cstevens@vermonthabitat.org>
Subject: United Church of Underhill - Affordable Housing Project
 
Hello Andrew,
 
                How are you? My name is Al Simard, and you might remember me from my Beartown Road
house that was built a few years ago. I have been involved in an affordable housing project with the
United Church of Underhill. I believe you have been talking to Sandy Wilmot about this project.
 
                So you know, we are applying for a  VCDP Planning Grant to help offset costs for the next
stage of the project. As part of this Grant application, I need to include some backup details for our
project budget. Could you tell me what we should plan for in regard to fees that we would be paying
as part of the review phase to this project? This Grant is only to cover the planning portion of the
project. Things like the building and driveway permits would not be part of this Grant application.
Having built a single home I remember there were some fees to submit plans for review. I suspect a
7 lot project might have larger fees for the review process, but I am not sure what to expect.
               
Thank you for your help,
 
Al Simard
 
 

Allen E. Simard
50 Beartown Road

Underhill, VT 05489
(802) 316-6818 (Cell)

(802) 448-3485 ext.106
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